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furniture and protective gear for
firefighters. 

“These fabrics have special
production, coating and lamina-
tion processes, and we want to
keep those patents here,” said
Robert Jou, a director at the
state-financed Taiwan Textile Re-
search Institute. 

Data from the Taiwan Stock
Exchange for 2010, the most re-
cent year for which figures are
available, show the average net
margin at textile companies was
12.7 percent, compared with 7.6
percent for companies producing
electronic products like semicon-
ductors, computers and commu-
nication components. 

Singtex owns 34 patents, in-
cluding one for S.Cafe, a polyes-
ter cloth with coffee grounds
mixed into it. The coffee grounds,
recycled from local 7-Eleven con-
venience stores and Starbucks
cafes, absorb odors, giving the
fabric added value for athletic
clothing. Singtex counts the Tim-
berland and Hugo Boss brands as
its customers and has even land-
ed a deal to supply fabric for the
Liverpool soccer club’s uniforms. 

Mr. Chen’s company survived
the industry’s exodus to China,
but many others did not. Exports
dropped by 44 percent in dollar
terms from 1997 to 2009, accord-
ing to data from the Taiwan Min-
istry of Finance. Mills that did
not do research and develop-
ment, or have the ability to invest
in innovation, could not compete
and went out of business. 

There were 7,752 textile compa-
nies in 1997, but by 2010, only
4,299 were left, according to the
textile institute’s data. 

“The ones that survived fo-
cused on innovative products to

for a new clothing line called FN
Ice and opened its first store in
Taipei in September. 

FN Ice’s creative director, Zoe
Chen, said Taiwan would eventu-
ally lose its technological edge,
and when that happens, the “only
way to add value will be through
promoting brands and lifestyle.” 

She said the textile industry
constantly had to adapt to the
harsh reality that there would al-
ways be a country that could
make what you were making at a
fraction of the price. 

“The Chinese are smart,” she
said of the mainland companies.
“They will catch up. So I’m al-
ways thinking of new ways to
push this fabric forward to be-
come something more.” 

up the production process.” 
Kingwhale is looking to be-

come partners with American
fabric labs to keep its edge. Mr.
Huang is planning a trip to North
Carolina State University this
month to buy a patent, and will
also check on the price of land
nearby for a possible factory to
supply fabric directly to the Unit-
ed States. He aims to find a new
fabric and turn it into a brand
that can be as recognizable as
Gore-Tex, the breathable, water-
proof fabric. 

Another company, the Lealea
Group, is taking a similar ap-
proach by building its own cloth-
ing brand. The company, a major
global nylon supplier, spent a
year designing about 150 pieces

“Our companies took a few
pages to the mainland, but they
avoided bringing the whole man-
ual,” Ms. Chen said. “Technolo-
gies like ultrathin, waterproof,
breathable fabrics, we still own.
In the future, we may need to
build spacesuits to stay ahead.” 

Peter Huang, the chairman of
Kingwhale Industries, a thermal
fleece supplier, said his clients
came to his company only after
failing to find mainland factories
that could meet their needs.
“They literally see our product,
tell us it’s nice, then fly to Shang-
hai or Guangzhou with our sam-
ple the next day,” Mr. Huang said.
“Then we get an awkward re-
quest from a Chinese factory ask-
ing us to teach them how to set

and its partner mills produced
350 types of fabrics to satisfy that
demand. 

“We chose to stay here be-
cause we saw that Taiwan still
had very innovative mills,” she
said. “But their marketing was
very weak. We provide the de-
sign and marketing platform so
that they can grab a share of the
global market.” 

Nimble companies like Singtex
and Hyperbola have powered the
textile sector’s resurrection. Ex-
ports for the entire industry, at
$12.7 billion in 2011, have climbed
to 24 percent below the 1997 peak.
But another measure of value,
the unit price of fabrics, has risen
by 41 percent since 1999 to $5.20
per kilogram, or 2.2 pounds, an
indication that the industry has
shifted to higher-value products. 

For those who made the shift to
more expensive cloth, profits
have surged. Singtex’s revenue
increased by 35 percent in 2011
from 2010 and its gross margin —
sales revenue minus the cost of
the goods — rose to more than 25
percent in 2011, according to Mr.
Chen of Singtex. He plans to take
his company public in 2013, and
declined to disclose more figures. 

Ms. Wang also declined to dis-
close Hyperbola’s financial per-
formance, but said, “Let’s just
say, it’s way better than most of
Taiwan’s tech companies.” 

Yet the good times might have
a short shelf life. Chinese textile
mills are learning and adopting
production technologies that
were first brought to the main-
land by investors from Taiwan.
Ms. Chen, the economist, esti-
mated that China was five to 10
years behind Taiwan technologi-
cally, which keeps the pressure
on companies in Taiwan to keep
innovating. 

serve higher-value demand in
Europe and United States,” said
Chen Lee-in, a senior economist
at the state-financed Chung-Hua
Institute for Economic Research.
“It really turned the notion that
textiles was a low-tech industry
on its head.” 

This new business environ-
ment spawned companies like
Hyperbola Textile, whose 24 em-
ployees work in a chic loft office
in Neihu, a high-technology hub
in Taipei. Hyperbola found its
niche in designing high-perform-
ance outdoor clothing, like ski
jackets and raincoats, and sup-
plies brands like Canada Goose,
Lululemon and Patagonia. It also
produces fade-resistant outdoor
cushions. 

The company has no factory.
Instead, it finds mills in Taiwan to
make the fabrics. 

Tina Wang, Hyperbola’s
founder, said that although her
clients made smaller orders in
Taiwan than they would in China,
they needed fabrics that could
withstand harsh weather condi-
tions and demanding environ-
ments, which Chinese mills often
lack the technology to produce. 

In 2011, Ms. Wang’s company
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Jason Chen, top left, founded Singtex Industrial to focus on developing higher-value, waterproof
synthetic cloth. Singtex owns 34 patents, including one for S.Cafe, a polyester cloth with coffee
grounds mixed into it. The Singtex factory, above, is in the Guanyin Township of Taiwan.

Textile Makers in Taiwan Carve Out
A Niche in High-Tech Clothing

Sample garments made of
fabrics produced by Singtex.
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used to bestow credit, determine
housing and even distinguish be-
tween job candidates. 

It’s so widely used that it has
also become a bigger factor in
dating decisions, sometimes
eclipsing more traditional priori-
ties like a good job, shared in-
terests and physical chemistry.
That’s according to interviews
with more than 50 daters across
the country, all under the age of
40. 

“Credit scores are like the dat-
ing equivalent of a sexually
transmitted disease test,” said
Manisha Thakor, the founder and
chief executive of MoneyZen
Wealth Management, a financial
advisory firm. “It’s a shorthand
way to get a sense of someone’s
financial past the same way an
S.T.D. test gives some informa-
tion about a person’s sexual
past.” 

It’s difficult to quantify how
many daters factor credit scores
into their romantic calculations,
but financial planners, marriage
counselors and dating site execu-
tives all said that they were hear-
ing far more concerns about
credit than in the past. “I’m get-
ting twice as many questions
about credit scores as I did prere-
cession,” Ms. Thakor said.

Executives who run online fi-

nancial advice forums say that
topics about credit and dating re-
ceive hundreds of responses
within minutes of being posted.
Alexa von Tobel, founder and
chief executive of Learnvest.com,
a financial planning firm, said
that members are more interest-
ed in credit scores than ever be-
fore. 

“It’s the only grade that mat-
ters after you graduate,” she said. 

Josephine La Bella, 25, who
works at a payroll company, likes
to tackle the delicate subject head
on. Ms. La Bella, who has vigi-
lantly monitored her credit score
ever since graduating from Rut-
gers in 2009, has found that
broaching the topic of her own
credit score causes her suitors to
open up, too.

In August, Ms. La Bella re-
called, while at dinner in Bay-
onne, N.J., a date blurted out his
credit score on the first outing.
Instead of making things more
awkward, she said, a really pro-
ductive discussion followed.
Since then, Ms. La Bella tries to
bring up the topic soon after
meeting someone.

“I take my credit score seri-
ously and so my date can take me
seriously,” she said. A handful of
small, online dating Web sites
have sprung up to cater specifi-
cally to singles looking for a part-
ner with a tiptop credit score.
“Good Credit Is Sexy,” says one
site, Creditscoredating.com,
which allows members to view

the credit scores of potential
dates who agree to provide the
numbers. 

On another site, Datemycredit
score.com, a member posted on
the Web site’s home page that
others should to “stop kidding”
themselves and realize that cred-
it scores do matter.

Dating someone with poor
credit can have real implications.
Banks remain wary of making
loans to borrowers with tar-
nished scores, typically 660 and
below; the best scores range
from 800 to 850, and scores above
750 are considered good. A low
score could quash dreams of buy-
ing a house, and result in steep
interest rates, up to 29 percent,
for credit cards, car financing
and other unsecured loans. 

A middling credit score can
also torpedo an application for an
apartment and drive up the cost
of cellphone plans and auto insur-
ance. And while eight states, in-
cluding California, Illinois and
Maryland, have passed laws lim-
iting employers ability to use
credit checks when assessing job
candidates, 13 percent of employ-
ers surveyed by the Society of
Human Resource Management
in July performed credit checks
on all job applicants. 

Lauren Dollard, a 26-year-old
assistant at a nonprofit in Hous-
ton, said her low credit score had
helped to stall her romantic

plans. Her boyfriend is wary of
marrying her until she can signif-
icantly pay down the more than
$150,000 she owes in student
loans and bolster her credit
score, she said.

Ms. Dollard’s credit score is so
low, around 600, that she hasn’t
been able to qualify for a car loan.
She sympathizes with her boy-
friend’s position because he
“doesn’t ever want to be account-
able for the irresponsible finan-
cial decision I made,” she said.
Her boyfriend declined to be in-
terviewed. 

John Hendrix, a 33-year-old
chemist in San Francisco, said he

worried that the vast disparity
between his girlfriend’s credit
score and his own low one could
create tension in their relation-
ship. When the couple leased a
car in October, Mr. Hendrix had
to leave his name off the contract
because his poor credit scuttled
his chances for the bargain in-
terest rate that his girlfriend
qualified for. 

Mr. Hendrix said he resented
that his credit score, which he
said was marred by a single con-
tested cable bill, has limited his
access to credit. “I always pay
my bills so it’s pretty ridiculous
that a billing error can ruin your

score,” he said. His girlfriend de-
clined to be interviewed.

Sarah Klein, who manages
myFICO Forums, an online dis-
cussion group, likens credit
scores to dieting because both af-
fect dating but often are shroud-
ed in secrecy. To motivate mem-
bers to openly discuss and re-
habilitate their credit scores, the
site runs an online contest called
the myFICO Fitness Challenge,
where participants try to in-
crease their scores. (FICO is a
name derived from Fair Isaac
Corporation.) Last year, more
than 24,000 members participat-
ed. 

In a post on the forum, one
member asked for advice after
finding out that her boyfriend’s
credit score hovered around 400.
Some members denounced the
member as petty and materialist-
ic while others counseled her to
run away from him. 

Ms. LaShawn, the flight attend-
ant from Chicago, said that she
was still shocked that her credit
score could sabotage a potential-
ly great date. She had accumulat-
ed credit card debt and sporadi-
cally fallen behind on bills, and
explained that she wasn’t sure of
her credit score, but was positive
that it wasn’t very good. 

Days after her failed date, she
said, she got an apologetic text
message. Her date reiterated
that the problem “wasn’t me, it
was my credit score.”

First Date With a Perfect 10? Never Mind That. Ask Her for Her Credit Score.
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Josephine La Bella, left, said she kept a close eye on her credit score since graduating and broached the subject with dates herself.
Jessica LaShawn said she was surprised when a date asked her about her credit score. “It was as if the music stopped,” she said. 
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Do not forget the Neediest!

5th-Lex Offices, Showrooms, Retail
B/t GRAND CENTRAL & PENN STA.

185 Mad., 353 Lex., 385 5th,
390 5th , 5 W 37th

620 SF to 8,620 SF
Owner Management

212-843-5400 Floor Plans on Website
www.HilsonManagement.com

35 ST W., #147 B'twn Broadway & 7th
500, 700 & 1400 sq ft, totally renov'd, new
windows, across from Macy's. NO FEE
falconproperties.com   212-302-3000

35th St #147 W. Btwn/B'way & Seventh
STORE - 1,200 Sq. Ft + MEZZANINE -

600 Sq. Ft. No Basement
FalconProperties.com 212-302-3000

Lex Ave. #1415 92nd &93rd St.
STORE FOR RENT - APPRX. 1,250 SF

Basement Storage Included. $9,000/mo.
Call 212-484-3764 www.OrsidR.com.0

A Machine Shop in QUEENS
For sale with or without building. Inquire
at: szerszamcsinalo@gmail.com
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